
2. THE ATONEMENT 
Sin and corruption. Repentance is not enough.

How do we think of sin? “Forgive us and restore us.” “the guilt and power of sin” 
'Because of our frailty we have committed” 

Nor does repentance recall men from what is according to their nature; all that it 
does is to make them cease from sinning. Had it been a case of a trespass only, 
and not of a subsequent corruption, repentance would have been well enough; but 
when once transgression had begun men came under the power of the 
corruption proper to their nature [???] and were bereft of the grace which 
belonged to them as creatures in the Image of God. No, repentance could not 
meet the case.

(p. 9)


[God knew the limitation of mankind, and provided three ways of helping: the 
testimony of creation, the teaching of wise men, and the law.]


What, then, was God to do? What else could He possibly do, being God, but 
renew His Image in mankind, so that through it men might once more come to 
know Him? And how could this be done save by the coming of the very Image 
Himself, our Saviour Jesus Christ? Men could not have done it, for they are only 
made after the Image;


(p. 13)


While he was a man he did not cease to uphold the universe. [see below]


3. HE MEETS US HALF-WAY 
Wherefore, in all naturalness and fitness, desiring to do good to men, as Man He 
dwells, taking to Himself a body like the rest; and through His actions done in that 
body, as it were on their own level, He teaches those who would not learn by 
other means to know Himself, the Word of God, and through Him the Father.


The Saviour of us all, the Word of God, in His great love took to Himself a body 
and moved as Man among men, meeting their senses, so to speak, half way. He 
became Himself an object for the senses, so that those who were seeking God in 
sensible things might apprehend the Father through the works which He, the Word 
of God, did in the body. Human and human-minded as men were, therefore, to 
whichever side they looked in the sensible world they found themselves taught the 
truth. Were they awe-stricken by creation? They beheld it confessing Christ as 
Lord. Did their minds tend to regard men as Gods? The uniqueness of the 
Saviour’s works marked Him, alone of men, as Son of God. Were they drawn to 
evil spirits? They saw them driven out by the Lord and learned that the Word of 



God alone was God and that the evil spirits were not gods at all. Were they inclined 
to hero-worship and the cult of the dead? Then the fact that the Saviour had 
risen from the dead showed them how false these other deities were, and that the 
Word of the Father is the one true Lord, the Lord even of death.

p. 14


He did not offer the sacrifice on behalf of all immediately He came, for if He had 
surrendered His body to death and then raised it again at once He would have 
ceased to be an object of our senses. Instead of that, He stayed in His body and 
let Himself be seen in it, doing acts and giving signs which showed Him to be not 
only man, but also God the Word. There were thus two things which the Saviour 
did for us by becoming Man. He banished death from us and made us anew; and, 
invisible and imperceptible as in Himself He is, He became visible through His 
works and revealed Himself as the Word of the Father, the Ruler and King of the 
whole creation.

p. 15


4. THE PARADOX


His body was for Him not a limitation, but an instrument, so that He was both in it 
and in all things, and outside all things, resting in the Father alone. At one and the 
same time—this is the wonder—as Man He was living a human life, and as Word 
He was sustaining the life of the universe, and as Son He was in constant union 
with the Father.


You must understand, therefore, that when writers on this sacred theme speak of 
Him as eating and drinking and being born, they mean that the body, as a body, 
was born and sustained with the food proper to its nature; while God the Word, 
Who was united with it, was at the same time ordering the universe and revealing 
Himself through His bodily acts as not man only but God.


p. 15


But beyond all this, there was a debt owing which must needs be paid; for, as I 
said before, all men were due to die. Here, then, is the second reason why the 
Word dwelt among us, namely that having proved His Godhead by His works, He 
might offer the sacrifice on behalf of all, surrendering His own temple to death in 
place of all, to settle man’s account with death and free him from the primal 
transgression. In the same act also He showed Himself mightier than death, 
displaying His own body incorruptible as the first-fruits of the resurrection.


You must not be surprised if we repeat ourselves in dealing with this subject, . . . 
and it is better to put the same thing in several ways than to run the risk of leaving 
something out.




The body of the Word, then, being a real human body, in spite of its having been 
uniquely formed from a virgin, was of itself mortal and, like other bodies, liable to 
death. But the indwelling of the Word loosed it from this natural liability, so that 
corruption could not touch it. Thus it happened that two opposite marvels took 
place at once: the death of all was consummated in the Lord’s body; yet, because 
the Word was in it, death and corruption were in the same act utterly abolished.


p. 17


5. HIS DEATH AND RESURRECTION  

[continues answering objections. Throughout this the emphasis is on Jesus’ 
sovereign choice in what happens. We tend to put the emphasis on what others 
did to him.]


remarkable statement about facing death: But now that the Saviour has raised His 
body, death is no longer terrible, but all those who believe in Christ tread it 
underfoot as nothing, and prefer to die rather than to deny their faith in Christ, 
knowing full well that when they die they do not perish, but live indeed, and 
become incorruptible through the resurrection. . . . There is proof of this too; for 
men who, before they believe in Christ, think death horrible and are afraid of it, 
once they are converted despise it so completely that they go eagerly to meet it, 
and themselves become witnesses of the Saviour’s resurrection from it. Even 
children hasten thus to die, and not men only, but women train themselves by 
bodily discipline to meet it.


p. 21


	 

The Saviour is [still] working mightily among men, every day He is invisibly 
persuading numbers of people all over the world, both within and beyond the 
Greek-speaking world, to accept His faith and be obedient to His teaching. Can 
anyone, in face of this, still doubt that He has risen and lives, or rather that He is 
Himself the Life?


pp. 22-23


[what’s different from today: witness of the martyrs, contrast of those who believe 
with those who worship false gods.]


SUMMARY:  
Indeed, it would seem that he who disbelieves this bodily rising of the Lord is 
ignorant of the power of the Word and Wisdom of God. If He took a body to 
Himself at all, and made it His own in pursuance of His purpose, as we have 
shown that He did, what was the Lord to do with it, and what was ultimately to 
become of that body upon which the Word had descended? Mortal and offered to 



death on behalf of all as it was, it could not but die; indeed, it was for that very 
purpose that the Saviour had prepared it for Himself. But on the other hand it 
could not remain dead, because it had become the very temple of Life. It therefore 
died, as mortal, but lived again because of the Life within it; and its resurrection is 
made known through its works. . . 


p. 23


[I]t is manifest, then, and let none presume to doubt it, that the Saviour has raised 
his own body, and that He is very Son of God, having His being from God as from 
a Father, Whose Word and Wisdom and Whose Power He is. He it is Who in these 
latter days assumed a body for the salvation of us all, and taught the world 
concerning the Father. He it is Who has destroyed death and freely graced us all 
with incorruption through the promise of the resurrection, having raised His own 
body as its first-fruits, and displayed it by the sign of the cross as the monument to 
His victory over death and its corruption.


p. 24



